

Exhibit A

EDWARD N. CAHN
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
JANUARY 1, 2010 TO FEBRUARY 28, 2010

Name of Professional	Position of the Professional, Number of Years in that Position, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Billed Hours	Total Compensation
Biron, T	Partner Since 1984, Member of PA Bar Since 1972, Member of NJ Bar Since 1987, Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$690.00	0.20	\$138.00
Fatell, B.	Partner Since 2000, Member of PA Bar Since 1981, Member of DE Bar Since 1999, Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$675.00	131.90	\$89,032.50
Jacobs, C.	Partner Since 2006, Member of PA Bar Since 1997, Area of Expertise - Business Tax	\$460.00	1.60	\$736.00
Daniels, J	Partner Since 2008, Member of PA Bar Since 1999, Member of the NY Bar Since 2008, Area of Expertise - Business	\$440.00	0.30	\$132.00
Laupheimer, A	Partner Since 1994 Member of PA Bar Since 1984, Area of Expertise - Litigation	\$600.00	1.5	\$900.00
Kelbon, R.	Partner Since 1991 Member of PA Bar Since 1985, Area of Expertise - Bankruptcy	\$600.00	29.6	\$17,760.00
Shapiro, J	Partner Since 1994 Member of PA Bar Since 1984, Area of Expertise - Financial Services/Real Estate	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
Storreo, J.	Partner Since 1999 Member of PA Bar Since 1986, Area of Expertise - Public Companies	\$625.00	39.3	\$24,562.50
Rotenberg, M	Partner Since 2004 Member of PA Bar Since 1998, Area of Expertise - Public Companies	\$450.00	0.7	\$315.00
Traub, S	Of Counsel, Member of PA Bar Since 1960, Area of Expertise - Business	\$590.00	41.6	\$24,544.00
Dibiase, K	Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2004, Member of the NJ Bar Since 2005 Area of Expertise - Business	\$340.00	3.10	\$1,054.00
Tarr, S.	Associate, Member of NY Bar Since 2005, Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$410.00	77.60	\$31,816.00
Stefanski, J	Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2007, Area of Expertise - Business	\$275.00	13.50	\$3,712.50
Bee, J	Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2009, Area of Expertise - Financial Services/Real Estate	\$245.00	8.40	\$2,058.00
Casey Spaniel, L	Associate, Member of PA and NJ Bar Since 2000, Area of Expertise - Business	\$415.00	98.00	\$40,670.00
Banson, T	Paralegal (Since 2001)	\$275.00	0.20	\$55.00
Senese, K.	Paralegal (Since 1993)	\$235.00	1.90	\$446.50
Kowalczyk, M.	Paralegal	\$230.00	1.90	\$437.00
Vaitl, J	Paralegal (Since 2007)	\$145.00	0.40	\$58.00
Moody, T.	Paralegal (Since 1996)	\$210.00	14.30	\$3,003.00
Root, A.	Law Clerk	\$260.00	11.9	\$3,094.00
Grand Total:			478.40	\$244,836.50

**EDWARD N.CAHN
PROJECT CODE SUMMARY
JANUARY 1, 2010 TO FEBRUARY 28, 2010**

PROJECT CODE	PROJECT CATEGORY	TOTAL HOURS	TOTAL FEES
1	Chapter 11 Trustee Specific Matters	0.0	\$0.00
2	Blank Rome Fee / Employment Applications	4.9	\$1,975.00
3	Other Professionals' Fee / Employment Issues	7.0	\$2,689.00
4	Debtors' Business Operations	262.4	\$141,571.50
5	Case Administration	4.6	\$1,288.50
6	IP Licensing	34.1	\$22,343.50
7	Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases	0.7	\$472.50
8	Claims Analysis and Objections	0.5	\$337.50
9	Employee Benefits / General Labor	1.8	\$1,165.50
10	Plan & Disclosure Statement	0.0	\$0.00
11	Sale of Assets / Asset Purchase Agreement	158.5	\$72,029.50
12	Stay Relief Issues	0.0	\$0.00
13	Tax Issues	0.0	\$0.00
14	Asset Analysis and Recovery	0.0	\$0.00
15	Hearings - Attendance / Preparation	3.9	\$964.00
16	Non-Working Travel	0.0	\$0.00
	TOTALS	478.4	\$244,836.50

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 02			
Jan 26 10	SCAN AND EFILE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION TO BLANK ROME'S FIRST COMBINED MONTHLY APPLICATION	MOODY	0.20
Jan 26 10	REVIEW INTERIM FEE ORDER, DRAFT CNO FOR BLANK ROME APPLICATION AND ATTEND TO THE FILING OF SAME;	TARR	0.50
Jan 27 10	REVIEW AND REVISE SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION AND CONFER WITH B. FATELL REGARDING SAME	TARR	2.00
Feb 09 10	PREPARE RESPONSE TO SCO, OPA REGARDING BLANK ROME INVOICES	TARR	0.50
Feb 12 10	REVIEW SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND APPROVE FOR FILING	FATELL	0.40
Feb 18 10	SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE BLANK ROME'S SECOND MONTHLY APPLICATION	MOODY	0.50
Feb 18 10	ATTEND TO FILING OF MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	TARR	0.80
PROJECT CODE TOTALS	02	TOTAL VALUE:	\$1,975.00
			4.90

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 03			
Jan 25 10	EMAILS TO OPA, B. FATELL REGARDING NOTICE FOR SALE MOTION (0.3); RESEARCH AND EMAIL SCO, OPA AND B. FATELL REGARDING BSF ENGAGEMENT (0.4)	TARR	0.70
Jan 26 10	SCAN AND EFILE OCEAN PARK'S CERTIFIACTE OF NO OBJECTION TO ITS FIRST COMBINED MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	MOODY	0.20
Jan 26 10	PREPARE SERVICE PAPERS AND FINALIZE OCEAN PARK'S SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION FOR FILING .4; SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE SAME .4	MOODY	0.80
Jan 26 10	DRAFT CNO FOR OPA FEE APPLICATION AND ATTEND TO FILING OF SAME (0.3); REVIEW OPA'S SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION, MAKE COMMENTS THERETO, CONFER WITH OPA REGARDING SAME AND ATTEND TO FILING OF SAME (0.6)	TARR	0.90
Feb 03 10	REVIEW PACHULSKI FEE APPLICATION (0.3); REVIEW AND COMMENTS TO OPA FEE APP (0.2)	TARR	0.50
Feb 04 10	PREPARE SERVICE PAPERS, SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE OCEAN PARK'S THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION PAPERS	MOODY	0.50
Feb 04 10	REVIEW AND COMMENTS TO OPA THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION AND ATTEND TO FILING OF SAME (1.0)	TARR	1.00
Feb 16 10	EMAIL REGARDING TANNER AND ACCOUNT'S FEES	FATELL	0.10
Feb 16 10	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING TANNER	TARR	0.30
Feb 16 10	REVIEW PACHULSKI CNO (0.2)	TARR	0.20
Feb 17 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. SINGER REGARDING HATCH COMPENSATION	FATELL	0.20
Feb 18 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON REGARDING PROFESSIONAL FEES	FATELL	0.10
Feb 18 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING PROFESSIONAL FEES	FATELL	0.20
Feb 19 10	SCAN AND EFILE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION REGARDING SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION OF OCEAN PARK ADVISORS	MOODY	0.20
Feb 19 10	DRAFT OPA FEE APPLICATION CNO, ATTEND TO FILING OF SAME AND EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING SAME	TARR	0.40
Feb 24 10	EMAILS REGARDING OPA FEE APPLICATION FILING AND STATUS OF PENDING APPLICATIONS, INCLUDING RESEARCH OF THE SAME	TARR	0.50

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Feb 25 10	EMAILS REGARDING OPA FEE APPLICATION STATUS	TARR	0.20
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 03		TOTAL VALUE: \$2,689.00	7.00

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 04			
Jan 04 10	EMAIL OPA AND TRUSTEE REGARDING UPDATE	FATELL	0.10
Jan 04 10	CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER AND M. FISLER REGARDING UPDATE ON VARIOUS MATTERS	FATELL	1.00
Jan 04 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING UPDATE ON VARIOUS MATTERS	FATELL	0.30
Jan 04 10	DETAILED EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING DEBTOR FINANCING	FATELL	0.20
Jan 04 10	MEET WITH B. FATELL AND S. TARR TO REVIEW OPEN ISSUES REGARDING SUSE, TRIAL, FINANCING, MDA , STOCK OPTION MOTION	KELBON	1.30
Jan 04 10	RECEIVE GUIDANCE FROM R. KELBON REGARDING STOCK OPTION MOTION (.10); REVISE AND UPDATE STOCK OPTION MOTION (3.2)	ROOT	3.30
Jan 04 10	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING FINANCING (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL AND R. KELBON REGARDING STATUS OF CASES	TARR	1.50
Jan 05 10	MEETING REGARDING DEBTOR FINANCING	FATELL	0.40
Jan 05 10	REVIEW TERM SHEET TO PREPARE FOR MEETING	FATELL	0.30
Jan 05 10	TELEPHONIC MEETING TO REVIEW TERMS FOR AGREEMENT WITH NORRIS	FATELL	1.90
Jan 05 10	REVIEW DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR DEBTOR LOAN	FATELL	0.10
Jan 05 10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH OPA AND R. TIBBITTS AND B. FATELL AND CASEY TO REVIEW MDA ISSUES	KELBON	2.30
Jan 05 10	PREPARE EMAIL TO M. FISLER ON CARVE OUT CONCEPT NEEDED IN FINANCING ORDER	KELBON	0.20
Jan 05 10	REVISE MOTION AND ORDER FOR OPTION AUTHORIZATION	KELBON	0.90
Jan 05 10	REVIEW AND REVISE RE: DOCUMENTS(1.0); EMAIL R. KELBON(0.2)	STORERO	1.20
Jan 05 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BUSINESS, FINANCIAL AND LEGAL REPRESENTATIVES REGARDING TERMS OF PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION AND SERVICES AGREEMENT WITH NYXIS(1.9); REVIEW AND REVISE TERM SHEET(0.9)	CASEY SPAN	2.80
Jan 06 10	REVIEW REVISED TERM SHEET FOR NORRIS DEAL AND MULTIPLE EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE	FATELL	0.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Jan 06 10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. TIBETTS REGARDING MOTION; FOLLOW UP EMAIL TO J. STORERO AND B. FATELL	KELBON	0.20
Jan 06 10	REVIEW MDA TERM SHEET	KELBON	0.30
Jan 06 10	REVIEW EMAIL AND RESPOND	STORERO	0.30
Jan 06 10	ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO TERM SHEET WITH NYXIS(1.0); ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF PREVIOUSLY NEGOTIATED PURCHASE AGREEMENT(0.8); REVIEW TRADEMARK LICENSES RELATED TO ASSETS(0.5); DRAFT SUMMARY OF OUTSTANDING ISSUES FOR TERM SHEET(0.6); FOLLOW UP WITH R. KELBON REGARDING LICENSING ISSUES(0.2)	CASEY SPAN	3.10
Jan 06 10	ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF LICENSING ISSUES IN DISTRICT COURT OPINION AND CASE LAW REGARDING TREATMENT OF LICENSES	CASEY SPAN	2.10
Jan 06 10	CONFER WITH OPA REGARDING SALE MOTION, RESEARCH ISSUE AND EMAIL OPA REGARDING SAME	TARR	0.70
Jan 07 10	REVIEW AND REVISE OPTIONS MOTION (.7); REVIEW UPDATED VERSION OF MOTION (.3)	FATELL	1.00
Jan 07 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON AND R. TIBBITTS REGARDING AGREEMENT WITH NORRIS	FATELL	0.80
Jan 07 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING OPERATIONS ISSUES	FATELL	0.40
Jan 07 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON AND L. CASEY REGARDING OPTIONS	FATELL	0.50
Jan 07 10	REVIEW MOTION REGARDING OPTIONS	FATELL	0.40
Jan 07 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON AND L. CASEY REGARDING TERM SHEET AND TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. TIBBITTS	FATELL	0.80
Jan 07 10	REVIEW REVISED TERM SHEET FOR DEAL WITH NORRIS	FATELL	0.20
Jan 07 10	CONFER WITH L. CASEY AND B. FATELL ON ISSUES RELATING TO MDA TERM SHEET AND PATCH IN R. TIBBETTS REGARDING SAME	KELBON	0.80
Jan 07 10	REVIEW ISSUES ON EXCLUSIVE V. NON-EXCLUSIVE LICENSES IN CONNECTION WITH MDA	KELBON	0.30
Jan 07 10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. FATELL AND R. KELBON (.40); TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON (.20); REVIEW PLANS; REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION (.40); EMAIL A. ROOT REGARDING MOTION (.20); EMAIL R.	STORERO	1.60

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	KELBON REGARDING QUESTION (.20); TELEPHONE CALL TO R. KELBON (.20)		
Jan 07 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON AND B. FATELL REGARDING REMAINING ISSUES IN TERM SHEET(0.8); FINALIZE REVISIONS(0.8); DISTRIBUTE TO WORKING GROUP WITH EMAIL SUMMARIZING THE ISSUES(0.2)	CASEY SPAN	1.80
Jan 07 10	REVIEW CHANGES AND OPEN ISSUES RELATED TO UPDATED DRAFT OF STOCK OPTION MOTION (.20); REVISE AND UPDATE STOCK OPTION MOTION TO REFLECT CHANGES REQUESTED BY R. KELBON (1.8)	ROOT	2.00
Jan 07 10	RESEARCH ASSIGNMENT ISSUE AND EMAIL R. KELBON REGARDING SAME (0.4)	TARR	0.40
Jan 08 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON AND THESTER REGARDING OPTIONS	FATELL	0.40
Jan 08 10	REVIEW ANNOUNCEMENT REGARDING CHANGE IN MANAGEMENT AND EDIT; EMAIL M. FISLER	FATELL	0.30
Jan 08 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING OPERATIONAL ACTIVITIES	FATELL	0.20
Jan 08 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING MANAGEMENT ISSUES	FATELL	0.20
Jan 08 10	CONFER WITH M. FISLER AND B. FATELL ON OPTION ISSUES	KELBON	0.40
Jan 08 10	WORK ON ADDITIONAL CHANGES TO MOTION AND EMAIL TO AND FROM RTIBBETS REGARDING MOTION AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING SAME	KELBON	0.80
Jan 08 10	CONFER WITH B. FATELL AND S. TARR	KELBON	0.40
Jan 08 10	CONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON (.40); PREPARE CERTIFICATE (.60); CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL AND R. KELBON (.40); EMAILS TO A. ROOT (.20); REVIEW MOTION (.20)	STORERO	1.80
Jan 08 10	SCAN, EFILE, PREPARE AND FINALIZE SERVICE OF STOCK OPTIONS MOTION	MOODY	0.70
Jan 08 10	REVISE AND EDIT STOCK OPTION MOTION AND ASSOCIATED DOCUMENTS (1.4); MULTIPLE EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CONVERSATIONS WITH S. TARR, R. KELBON, R. TIBBITTS AND K. NIELSEN REGARDING REVISIONS TO STOCK OPTION MOTION AND NECESSARY STEPS FOR FILING (.8); FINALIZE AND PREPARE STOCK OPTION MOTION FOR FILING (.30)	ROOT	2.60

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Jan 08 10	REVIEW STOCK OPTION MOTION IN PREPARATION FOR FILING AND CONFER WITH A. ROOT, R. KELBON SEVERAL TIMES REGARDING SAME (0.5); RESEARCH ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL ISSUE FOR B. FATELL AND EMAIL REGARDING SAME (0.4)	TARR	0.90
Jan 11 10	REVIEW MATERIALS (.3) AND TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH OPA (1.6)	FATELL	1.90
Jan 11 10	EMAILS REGARDING FINANCING	FATELL	0.20
Jan 11 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER AND M. BURTON REGARDING FINANCING	FATELL	0.60
Jan 11 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING FINANCING AND ASSET SALES	FATELL	0.30
Jan 11 10	TEAM CONFERENCE CALL	KELBON	1.60
Jan 11 10	CONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON(0.3); REVIEW EMAILS FROM CLIENT(0.2); EMAIL A. ROOT(0.1)	STORERO	0.60
Jan 11 10	REVIEW E-MAIL REGARDING BLUE SKY EXEMPTION FROM REGISTRATION FOR SALES IN UTAH; TELEPHONE J. STORERO REGARDING SAME	BANSON	0.20
Jan 11 10	FOLLOW UP WITH M. FISLER REGARDING ISSUES IN TERM SHEET	CASEY SPAN	0.50
Jan 11 10	FOLLOW UP ON VARIOUS EMAILS RELATED TO STOCK OPTION MOTION (.30)	ROOT	0.30
Jan 12 10	EMAILS REGARDING SEC FILINGS	FATELL	0.10
Jan 12 10	TEAM CONFERENCE	FATELL	1.00
Jan 12 10	SCAN LOAN DOCUMENTS	FATELL	0.20
Jan 12 10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH SCO/OPA REGARDING OPERATIONS	KELBON	1.00
Jan 12 10	FOLLOW UP WITH R. KELBON AND B. FATELL REGARDING LICENSING ISSUES IN TERM SHEET(0.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES IN TERM SHEET(0.4); FURTHER REVISIONS TO TERM SHEET(2.0)	CASEY SPAN	2.60
Jan 12 10	RESEARCH AND RESPOND TO VARIOUS ISSUES REGARDING DIRECTOR EXERCISE OF STOCK OPTIONS (1.0)	ROOT	1.00
Jan 13 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER	FATELL	0.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
 Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Jan 13 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH TRUSTEE	FATELL	0.20
Jan 13 10	CONFERENCE WITH J. STEFANSKI REGARDING BACKGROUND ISSUES IN PRIOR TRANSACTION AND TERM SHEET AND RESEARCH ON LICENSING ISSUES(0.6); REVIEW COMMENTS TO TERM SHEET FROM R. TIBBITTS(0.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL AND R. KELBON REGARDING ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO TERM SHEET(0.4); REVIEW AND REVISE TERM SHEET(0.6); REVIEW ADDITIONAL COMMENTS FROM R. TIBBITTS(0.2); FINALIZE REVISIONS TO TERM SHEET(0.2)	CASEY SPAN	2.40
Jan 13 10	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING RESEARCH OF EXCLUSIVE AND NON-EXCLUSIVE COPYRIGHT LICENSE AGREEMENTS(0.6); RESEARCH ISSUE(1.7); BEGIN DRAFT REPORTING EMAIL REGARDING FINDINGS(0.8)	STEFANSKI	3.10
Jan 14 10	COMPLETE RESEARCH REGARDING NON-EXCLUSIVE AND EXCLUSIVE COPYRIGHT LICENSES(2.0); DRAFT EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING FINDINGS(0.8); REVISE AND EDIT EMAIL AND SUBMIT TO L. CASEY(0.4)	STEFANSKI	3.20
Jan 14 10	REVIEW LENDING AGREEMENT (2.6 HOURS); CONFERENCE WITH E. CAHN - INTRO TO CLIENT MATTER (1.0 HOURS); TELECONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON (0.2 HOURS); TELECONFERENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS (0.1 HOURS); AND EMAIL TO R. TIBBITTS (0.1 HOURS)	TRAUB	4.00
Jan 15 10	REVIEW PETROFSKY EMAILS REGARDING OPTIONS MOTION	FATELL	0.20
Jan 15 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER AND R. TIBBITTS REGARDING MOBILITY, OPTIONS AND FINANCING, ETC.	FATELL	0.50
Jan 15 10	EMAILS REGARDING NORRIS TERM SHEET	FATELL	0.10
Jan 15 10	REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. PETROFSKY (.2) ; EMAIL TO GROUP QUESTIONS AND ISSUES (.1) ; CONFER WITH J. STORERO (.1) ; REVIEW J. STORERO'S PRELIMINARY RESPONSE (.1)	KELBON	0.50
Jan 15 10	REVIEW EMAILS AND RESPOND(0.4); CONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON(0.4)	STORERO	0.80
Jan 15 10	REVIEW AND ANALYZE INFORMAL RESPONSE TO STOCK OPTION MOTION AND RELATED INTERNAL DISCUSSIONS TO INFORMAL RESPONSE (.70);	ROOT	0.70
Jan 15 10	CONFER WITH A. ROOT REGARDING STOCK OPTIONS (0.3), EMAIL RESPONSE TO PETROFSKY REGARDING SAME (0.2), CONFER WITH B. FATELL REGARDING	TARR	1.00

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	SAME (0.3), REVIEW PETROFSKY RESPONSE (0.2);		
Jan 15 10	REVIEW SCO STORY (0.2); REVIEW YARRO BACKGROUND (0.1); AND EMAILS ON NORRIS DEAL (0.5); TELECONFERENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS (0.2)	TRAUB	1.00
Jan 18 10	REVIEW EMAILS(0.3); EMAIL R. KELBON(0.3)	STORERO	0.60
Jan 19 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING STATUS OF VARIOUS MATTERS	FATELL	0.20
Jan 19 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON REGARDING OPEN ISSUES	FATELL	0.40
Jan 19 10	REVIEW SERIES OF EMAILS REGARDING OPTIONS	FATELL	0.20
Jan 19 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON REGARDING OPTIONS	FATELL	0.10
Jan 19 10	EMAILS REGARDING MEETINGS IN EUROPE	FATELL	0.20
Jan 19 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON REGARDING OPTIONS	FATELL	0.40
Jan 19 10	CONFER WITH B. FATELL ON NUMEROUS OPEN ISSUES	KELBON	0.20
Jan 19 10	CONFER WITH J. STORERO ON EMAILS ON RESPONSE TO AP'S QUESTIONS CONCERNING OPTIONS AND FOLLOW UP	KELBON	0.30
Jan 19 10	CONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON (0.2); PREPARE RESPONSE (2.2)	STORERO	2.40
Jan 20 10	REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT RESPONSE TO PETROFSKY REGARDING OPTIONS AND DISCUSS WITH J. STORERO	FATELL	0.60
Jan 20 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER REGARDING VARIOUS TRANSACTIONS REGARDING SALES AND FINANCING	FATELL	0.30
Jan 20 10	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS AND ANALYSIS REGARDING OPTIONS AND PETROFSKY INQUIRIES	FATELL	0.40
Jan 20 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH G. HIGGS FROM TOG AND REPORT TO OPA AND R. TIBBITTS	FATELL	0.40
Jan 20 10	DRAFT AND REPLY TO A. PETROFSKY	FATELL	0.30
Jan 20 10	EMAILS AND CALLS WITH J. STORERO REGARDING A. PETROFSKY; EMAILS TO AND FROM B. FATELL REGARDING SAME	KELBON	0.40
Jan 20 10	REVISE LETTER(0.8); RESPOND TO EMAILS(0.5); CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL(0.5)	STORERO	2.80
Jan 20 10	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING DIRECTOR STOCK OPTIONS	ROOT	0.20
Jan 21 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. STORERO AND EMAIL A.	FATELL	0.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
 Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	PETROFSKY REGARDING RESOLUTIONS		
Jan 21 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING PETROFSKY ISSUES	FATELL	0.10
Jan 21 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH A. PETROFSKY AND TRUSTEE; FOLLOW UP WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING BOARD OPTIONS	FATELL	0.60
Jan 21 10	REVIEW REDACTED RESOLUTIONS	KELBON	0.20
Jan 21 10	REVIEW ISSUES RELATING TO OPTIONS	KELBON	0.20
Jan 21 10	CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL(0.2); REVIEW AND REDACT DOCUMENTS(1.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO B. FATELL(0.2); TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM R. KELBON(0.2)	STORERO	1.80
Jan 21 10	OBTAIN AND REDACT AUGUST 3, 2009 BOARD RESOLUTIONS (.50); COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. KELBON REGARDING SAME (.10)	ROOT	0.60
Jan 22 10	REVIEW TERM SHEET; SEND REDLINED TERM SHEET TO FATELL, KELBON & CAHN; CONFERENCE WITH E. CAHN	TRAUB	1.50
Jan 22 10	REVIEW AND REVISE LOAN AGREEMENT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH FISLER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH FATELL; CONFERENCE WITH E. CAHN	TRAUB	4.50
Jan 25 10	REVIEW DOCUMENT(0.1); EMAIL R. KELBON(0.1)	STORERO	0.20
Jan 25 10	REVIEW OF STOCK OPTIONS ORDER AND EMAIL SCO, OPA AND BR TEAMS REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEW OF EMAILS WITH OPA, B. FATELL REGARDING SAME (0.2)	TARR	0.60
Jan 26 10	REVIEW AND APPROVE CA FOR TRUSTEE	FATELL	0.30
Jan 26 10	REVISE CERTIFICATION(0.4); EMAIL A. ROOT AND R. KELBON(0.2)	STORERO	0.60
Jan 26 10	REVIEW VARIOUS EMAILS AND DOCUMENTS CONCERNING POST-PETITION STOCK OPTIONS GRANTED TO THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS (.20)	ROOT	0.20
Jan 26 10	REVIEW LOAN AGREEMENT AND MAKE RECOMMENDED CHANGES; DRAFT FORWARDING EMAIL	TRAUB	3.00
Jan 26 10	CORRESPONDENCE WITH MARK FISLER AND BONNIE FATELL; TELECONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER	TRAUB	1.00
Jan 27 10	REVIEW DEBTOR LOAN AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.80
Jan 27 10	CONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER AND S. TRAUB	FATELL	1.20

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Jan 27 10	DRAFT EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO WORKING GROUP REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES(0.5)	CASEY SPAN	0.50
Jan 27 10	COMMUNICATIONS WITH S. TARR REGARDING MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS AND OPEN STOCK OPTION ISSUES	ROOT	0.30
Jan 27 10	REVIEW AND ANALYZE RESPONSES TO EMEA QUESTIONS AND EMAIL B. FATELL REGARDING SAME (0.6); REVIEW SCO EMAIL REGARDING VENDOR ISSUE AND EMAIL B. FATELL REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEW AND ANALYZE SOFAS AND SCHEDULES IN CONNECTION WITH RESPONDING TO QUESTIONS FROM B. FATELL AND DRAFT EMAIL TO B. FATELL REGARDING SAME (1.0)	TARR	2.00
Jan 27 10	CORRESPONDENCE TO M. FISLER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH FISLER AND FATELL	TRAUB	2.00
Jan 27 10	REVISE DRAFT LOAN AGREEMENT	TRAUB	3.00
Jan 28 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER AND B. COMER REGARDING AGENDA FOR TRIP TO EUROPE	FATELL	1.00
Jan 28 10	FURTHER EMAIL TO B. FATELL REGARDING SOFAS AND SCHEDULES AFTER FURTHER REVIEW OF SAME (0.8); REVIEW EMEA PRESENTATION FORM OPA AND CONFER WITH OPA REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEW SARL FRANCE REPORTS, COMMUNICATE WITH B. FATELL, SCO AND OPA REGARDING SAME(0.6)	TARR	1.80
Jan 28 10	REVISE LOAN AGREEMENT AND TRANSMIT TO M. FISLER, B. FATELL AND E. CAHN	TRAUB	3.00
Jan 29 10	FURTHER REVISE AND REVIEW FINANCING MOTION	TARR	2.00
Jan 29 10	REVIEW CHANGES FROM MARK FISLER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER RE TRANSMISSION OF DOCUMENT TO HOLLAND & HART	TRAUB	1.00
Jan 31 10	REVIEW Q & A FOR MEETING WITH EUROPEAN SUBSIDIARIES AND EMAIL OCEAN PARK ADVISORS	FATELL	0.30
Feb 01 10	EMAIL J. MCMAHON REGARDING MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS	FATELL	0.10
Feb 02 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO H. JACKSON REGARDING MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS	FATELL	0.10
Feb 02 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH LENDERS COUNSEL	FATELL	0.40
Feb 02 10	EMAIL TO A. LAUPHEIMER RE: DIRECTORS AND OFFICERS INSURANCE POLICIES	KELBON	0.20
Feb 02 10	REVIEW MATERIALS ON INSURANCE ISSUES	KELBON	0.10

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Feb 03 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING EUROPE TRIP	FATELL	0.50
Feb 03 10	REVIEW CREDIT AGREEMENT AND REVISE	FATELL	0.80
Feb 03 10	REVIEW DRAFT DEBTOR CREDIT MOTION	FATELL	0.60
Feb 03 10	REVIEW EMAILS ON DIRECTOR AND OFFICER POLICIES	KELBON	0.20
Feb 03 10	EMAIL TO AND FROM A. LAUPHEIMER ON DIRECTORS AND OFFICERS INSURANCE ISSUES	KELBON	0.10
Feb 03 10	EMAIL FROM V. BHAT	KELBON	0.10
Feb 03 10	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING MORS (0.3); CONTINUE DRAFTING FINANCING MOTION AND RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (5.0)	TARR	5.30
Feb 03 10	RESPOND TO EMAILS RE: SCHEDULING OF CONFERENCE CALL	TRAUB	0.30
Feb 04 10	EMAILS REGARDING PREPARATION OF MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS	FATELL	0.20
Feb 04 10	UPDATE REPORT FROM S. TARR	FATELL	0.10
Feb 04 10	REVIEW OCEAN PARK ADVISORS INITIAL REPORT ON EUROPEAN SUBSIDIARIES	FATELL	0.10
Feb 04 10	EMAILS REGARDING MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	FATELL	0.10
Feb 04 10	MULTIPLE EMAIL REGARDING DEBTOR LOAN AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Feb 04 10	EMAIL A. LAUPHEIMER ON INSURANCE ISSUES	KELBON	0.10
Feb 04 10	REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. LAUPHEIMER ON INSURANCE ISSUES	KELBON	0.10
Feb 04 10	REVIEW INSURANCE POLICY AND PROVIDE ANSWERS REGARDING DIRECTORS AND OFFICERS COVERAGE FOR JUDGE CAHN AND OTHERS	LAUPHEIMER	1.50
Feb 04 10	CONFERENCE WITH STANLEY TARR REGARDING OPTIONS(0.4); CONFERENCE WITH A. ROOT REGARDING OPTIONS(0.4)	STORERO	0.80
Feb 04 10	CONTINUED ATTENTION TO OPEN ISSUES SURROUNDING POST-PETITION STOCK OPTIONS GRANTED TO DIRECTORS	ROOT	0.30
Feb 04 10	REVIEW OPA'S EMAIL SUMMARY REGARDING EUROPE (0.2); REVISE FINANCING MOTION AND EMAIL B. FATELL REGARDING SAME (3.0)	TARR	3.20

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Feb 05 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH EUROPEAN TEAM	FATELL	0.50
Feb 05 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. TARR REGARDING PENDING MATTERS	FATELL	0.40
Feb 05 10	EMAILS WITH OCEAN PARK ADVISORS REGARDING MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS	FATELL	0.10
Feb 05 10	REVIEW MORS	KELBON	0.20
Feb 05 10	EMAILS TO AND FROM J. STORERO ON OPTION ISSUES	KELBON	0.10
Feb 05 10	MEETING WITH S. TARR REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES RELATED TO POST-PETITION GRANTS OF STOCK OPTIONS TO CERTAIN DIRECTORS	ROOT	0.10
Feb 05 10	EMAILS WITH B. FATELL RE MORS (0.3) AND SEVERAL EMAILS WITH J. STORERO REGARDING STOCK OPTIONS (0.5)	TARR	0.80
Feb 08 10	REVIEW LENDERS COMMENTS AND REVISIONS TO LOAN AGREEMENT (.8); DISCUSS WITH S. TRAUB (.3)	FATELL	1.10
Feb 08 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. TRAUB AND M. FISLER REGARDING DEBTOR LOAN	FATELL	0.40
Feb 08 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING ETRADE ACCOUNT AND EMPLOYEE COMMUNICATIONS	FATELL	0.30
Feb 08 10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. YARRO AND COUNSEL, M. FISLER, S. TRAUB REGARDING DEBTOR LOAN	FATELL	1.10
Feb 08 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO R. TIBBITTS REGARDING DEBTOR LOAN	FATELL	0.10
Feb 08 10	REVIEW LETTER FROM GERMANY COUNSEL	FATELL	0.40
Feb 08 10	EMAILS TO AND FROM K. NIELSON REGARDING ETRADE	KELBON	0.10
Feb 08 10	CONFER WITH J. STORERO ON ETRADE ISSUES	KELBON	0.20
Feb 08 10	CONFERENCE WITH T. STEPHENSON (.60); REVIEW EMAILS (.40); TELEPHONE CALL TO R. KELBON AND EMAILS TO R. KELBON AND B. FATELL (.40); RESPOND TO VARIOUS EMAILS (.40)	STORERO	1.80
Feb 08 10	ATTEND TO GERMAN LEGAL ADVICE ISSUE AND CONFER WITH B. FATELL, OPA REGARDING SAME (1.0); DRAFT EMAIL TO SCO, OPA REGARDING STOCK OPTIONS AND INTERNAL CONFERENCES AND EMAILS REGARDING SAME (0.4)	TARR	1.40
Feb 08 10	FOUR TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH BONNIE FATELL, INCLUDING CALL WITH M. FISLER AND HOLLAND &	TRAUB	5.00

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	HART; REVIEW CHANGES MADE BY HOLLAND & HART; NUMEROUS EMAILS		
Feb 09 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH LENDERS' COUNSEL TO REVIEW CREDIT AGREEMENT AND OPEN ISSUES AND REVIEW SUMMARY MEMO FROM C. BURTON	FATELL	1.30
Feb 09 10	EMAIL H. BAYER REGARDING MEETINGS IN EUROPE	FATELL	0.10
Feb 09 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. KELBON AND J. STORERO REGARDING COMPANY COMMUNICATIONS ON OPTIONS	FATELL	0.60
Feb 09 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. BURTON AND REVIEW EDITS TO CREDIT AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.40
Feb 09 10	REVIEW EMAIL FROM K. NIELSON; NUMEROUS DISCUSSIONS WITH J. STORERO ON ISSUES RELATING TO STOCK ISSUANCE; CONFER WITH R. TIBBETTS; PATCH IN K. NIELSON; CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL; EMAILS TO K. NEILSON; FOLLOW UP DISCUSSIONS WITH J. STORERO	KELBON	1.80
Feb 09 10	REVIEW ISSUES AND DISCUSS FURTHER WITH J. STORERO	KELBON	0.30
Feb 09 10	REVIEW EMAIL FROM K. NIELSEN(0.6); TELEPHONE CALL TO R. KELBON REGARDING EMAIL(0.3); RESPOND TO EMAIL TO K. NIELSEN(0.4); TELEPHONE CALL TO R. TIBBITTS WITH R. KELBON(0.6); TELEPHONE CALL TO K. NIELSEN WITH R. KELBON AND R. TIBBITTS(0.6); TELEPHONE CALL TO TRANSFER AGENT(0.9); DRAFT LETTERS(3.6); EMAIL B. FATELL AND R. KELBON(0.2)	STORERO	7.20
Feb 09 10	CONFERENCES WITH J. STORERO, A. ROOT REGARDING STOCK OPTION STATUS, RESEARCH MEMOS REGARDING SAME AND DRAFT EMAIL TO SCO, OPA REGARDING SAME	TARR	1.50
Feb 09 10	REVIEW EMAILS ON BUSINESS POINTS AND SCHEDULING	TRAUB	0.50
Feb 10 10	CONFERENCE REGARDING SECURITIES ISSUES	FATELL	1.80
Feb 10 10	EMAIL WITH M. BARTON REGARDING LOAN AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Feb 10 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH B. COMER AND M. FISLER REGARDING VARIOUS MATTERS	FATELL	0.80
Feb 10 10	REVIEW LOAN AGREEMENT AND REVISED REPRESENTATIONS AND WARRANTIES	FATELL	0.60
Feb 10 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. BURTON REGARDING LOAN AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.50

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Feb 10 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING DEBTOR LOAN	FATELL	0.20
Feb 10 10	EMAIL WITH K. NIELSEN REGARDING MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS	FATELL	0.20
Feb 10 10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. FATELL AND J. STORERO REGARDING RECENT EVENTS AND ISSUES RELATING TO STOCK OPTIONS	KELBON	1.90
Feb 10 10	CONFER WITH A. ROOT REGARDING EXTENSION OF TIME FOR EXERCISE	KELBON	0.10
Feb 10 10	WORK ON OPTION EXTENSION MOTION	KELBON	0.90
Feb 10 10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. KELBON AND B. FATELL REGARDING OPTIONS (1.8); RESPOND TO EMAILS (0.4); TELEPHONE CALL TO R. TIBBITTS (1.0)	STORERO	3.20
Feb 10 10	CONTINUED ATTENTION TO ISSUES RELATING TO POST-PETITION STOCK OPTION GRANTS	ROOT	0.30
Feb 10 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING OPA CONFERENCE CALL SCHEDULING (0.4); REVIEW SEVERAL EMAILS REGARDING MORS AMONG BLANK ROME TEAM, OPA (0.3)	TARR	0.70
Feb 11 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON REGARDING OPTIONS	FATELL	0.10
Feb 11 10	REVIEW AND EDIT LETTER TO K. NIELSEN AND EMAIL TRUSTEE REGARDING SAME	FATELL	0.40
Feb 11 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON REGARDING OPTIONS	FATELL	0.40
Feb 11 10	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO EXTEND STOCK OPTION PERIODS	FATELL	1.40
Feb 11 10	WORK ON EXTENSION MOTION	KELBON	1.00
Feb 11 10	EMAIL FROM B. COMER ON BUDGETED ITEMS	KELBON	0.10
Feb 11 10	EMAILS TO AND FROM B. FATELL ON EXERCISE ISSUE	KELBON	0.10
Feb 11 10	RESPOND TO EMAILS(0.4); PREPARE LETTER(0.6); EMAIL K. NIELSEN(0.2); REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION(0.6); EMAIL R. KELBON REGARDING MOTION(0.4)	STORERO	2.20
Feb 12 10	REVIEW R. YARRO COMMUNICATION WITH POTENTIAL LENDERS	FATELL	0.10
Feb 12 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING EMPLOYEE MORALE ISSUES	FATELL	0.30
Feb 12 10	REVIEW AND REVISE LETTER TO K. NIELSEN AND R.	FATELL	0.20

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
 Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	TIBBITTS		
Feb 12 10	EMAIL TO M. BURTON AND C. BARTON REGARDING SECURITY INTERESTS	FATELL	0.10
Feb 12 10	EMAIL R. TIBBITTS REGARDING FINANCING; EMAIL M. BURTON REGARDING SAME	FATELL	0.30
Feb 12 10	EMAIL WITH M. BURTON REGARDING FINANCING DOCUMENTS	FATELL	0.30
Feb 12 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING LOAN	FATELL	0.20
Feb 12 10	DISCUSSIONS WITH B. FATELL ON ISSUES RELATING TO EXTENSION ETC	KELBON	0.20
Feb 12 10	REVISE LETTER(0.8); EMAIL B. FATELL(0.2); EMAIL R. KELBON(0.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO B. FATELL(0.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO TRANSFER AGENT(0.6); REVISE LETTER(0.2)	STORERO	2.20
Feb 13 10	REVIEW LOAN AGREEMENT WITH SUBSTANTIAL CHANGES, REVIEW EXHIBITS	FATELL	1.80
Feb 13 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. TRAUB REGARDING MODIFICATIONS TO LOAN AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.60
Feb 13 10	REVIEW AND REVISE CREDIT AGREEMENT(3.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL(0.6); CORRESPOND WITH EMAILS(0.4)	TRAUB	4.00
Feb 14 10	REVIEW AND EDIT CREDIT AGREEMENT	FATELL	1.80
Feb 14 10	EMAILS REGARDING OPEN ISSUES IN CREDIT AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Feb 15 10	CONFERENCE WITH M. BURTON, C. BURTON AND S. TRAUB REGARDING CREDIT AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.80
Feb 15 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON REGARDING MOTION TO APPROVE CREDIT AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.40
Feb 15 10	EMAIL R. YARRO REGARDING MINIMUM LOAN AMOUNT	FATELL	0.10
Feb 15 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON REGARDING LOAN DOCUMENTS	FATELL	0.20
Feb 15 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON REGARDING OPTIONS	FATELL	0.30
Feb 15 10	REVISE CREDIT AGREEMENT	FATELL	1.30
Feb 15 10	WORK ON DRAFT FINANCING ORDER(2.0); CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL; PREPARE EMAIL REGARDING ISSUES TO REVIEW(0.3)	KELBON	2.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Feb 15 10	REVIEW REVISED CREDIT AGREEMENT AND EXHIBITS; CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. FATELL AND HOLLAND & HART	TRAUB	4.00
Feb 16 10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH OCEAN PARK ADVISORS AND TRUSTEE REGARDING UPDATE ON OPERATIONS AND RESTRUCTURING PLANS	FATELL	1.70
Feb 16 10	CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL	SHAPIRO	0.50
Feb 16 10	FURTHER WORK ON DRAFT FINANCING ORDER	KELBON	2.00
Feb 16 10	FURTHER WORK ON FINANCING ORDER AND PREPARE EMAIL TO B. FATELL	KELBON	0.50
Feb 16 10	CONFERENCES WITH B. FATELL ON FINANCING AND ISSUES TO ADDRESS	KELBON	0.40
Feb 16 10	REVIEW EMAILS AND DISCUSS WITH J. STORERO	KELBON	0.20
Feb 16 10	CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING CONFIRMATION; REVISE SAME; RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM B. FATELL AND R. KELBON; EMAIL R. TIBBITTS REGARDING SHARES; EMAIL B. FATELL; EMAIL TRANSFER AGENT	STORERO	1.60
Feb 16 10	CONFER WITH B. FATELL REGARDING "DEEMED DIVIDEND" ISSUE WITH RESPECT TO PLEDGE OF STOCK IN FOREIGN SUBSIDIARIES; PREPARE SUGGESTED INSERTS FOR SECURITY AGREEMENT	ROTENBERG	0.70
Feb 16 10	REVIEW OPA PRESENTATION REGARDING OPERATIONS (0.6); RESEARCH REGARDING FINANCING MOTION AND FURTHER REVISIONS AND DRAFTING REGARDING SAME (4.0); REVIEW OF EMAILS REGARDING FILING OF MOTIONS FROM WEEK PRIOR (0.4)	TARR	5.00
Feb 16 10	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING TRADEMARK MATTER	TARR	0.30
Feb 16 10	REVIEW FATELL'S REVISIONS; EMAIL FATELL	TRAUB	1.00
Feb 17 10	REVIEW REVISED ORDER APPROVING CREDIT AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.30
Feb 17 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH MONA BURTON REGARDING CREDIT TERMS	FATELL	0.60
Feb 17 10	REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE CREDIT AGREEMENT; NEGOTIATIONS WITH LENDERS AND REVISE ORDER	FATELL	3.20
Feb 17 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH C. BARTON REGARDING CREDIT AGREEMENT (SEVERAL CALLS)	FATELL	0.30
Feb 17 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON REGARDING CREDIT	FATELL	0.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	AGREEMENT		
Feb 17 10	REVIEW AND EDIT CREDIT AGREEMENT ORDER	FATELL	0.70
Feb 17 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH C. BARTON TO REVIEW CHANGES TO CREDIT AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.60
Feb 17 10	CONFER WITH B. FATELL OVER FINANCING ISSUE	KELBON	0.30
Feb 17 10	REVISE LANGUAGE IN LETTER(0.4); EMAIL TRANSFER AGENT(0.2)	STORERO	0.60
Feb 17 10	ATTEND TO FILING OF FINANCING MOTION, INCLUDING SUBSTANTIAL REVISIONS TO MOTION AND EXHIBITS, CONFERENCES WITH B. FATELL, FILING SERVICE REGARDING SAME	TARR	7.50
Feb 17 10	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING MORS	TARR	0.30
Feb 18 10	REVIEW MEMOS REGARDING FINANCING AND DISCUSS ISSUES WITH S. TARR	FATELL	1.30
Feb 18 10	MEETING WITH S. TARR REGARDING FINANCING MOTION	FATELL	0.30
Feb 18 10	CONFER WITH S. TARR ON MOR ISSUES	KELBON	0.20
Feb 18 10	REVIEW MORS	KELBON	0.20
Feb 18 10	REVIEW EMAIL ON EMPLOYEE EXERCISE; CONFER WITH J. STORERO AND EMAIL TO B. FATELL REGARDING SAME	KELBON	0.20
Feb 18 10	CONFER WITH S.TARR ON SEARCHES NEEDED	KELBON	0.10
Feb 18 10	REVIEW EMAIL FROM COMPANY(0.2); RESPOND TO EMAIL(0.2); EMAIL R. TIBBITTS(0.4); EMAIL B. FATELL AND R. KELBON(0.2)	STORERO	0.90
Feb 18 10	RESEARCH, PREPARE AND COORDINATE WITH PARCELS AND S. TARR REGARDING SERVICE FOR FINANCING MOTION AND RELATED MOTION TO SHORTEN	MOODY	4.10
Feb 18 10	SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS FOR OCTOBER	MOODY	0.50
Feb 18 10	SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF MOTION TO SHORTEN NOTICE REGARDING FINANCING MOTION	MOODY	0.20
Feb 18 10	FINALIZE SERVICE OF FINANCING MOTION PAPERS	MOODY	0.60
Feb 18 10	DRAFT WITHDRAWAL AND ATTEND TO FILING OF SAME (0.6); REVIEW ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO SHORTEN AND CONSIDER SAME(0.3)	TARR	0.90

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Feb 18 10	SEVERAL INTERNAL CONFERENCES REGARDING SERVICE OF FINANCING MOTION AND EMAIL SERVICE REGARDING SAME (1.3); REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING UCC SEARCHES AND INTERNAL CONFERENCES REGARDING FINANCING MOTION MATTERS (0.4)	TARR	1.70
Feb 18 10	ATTEND TO FILING OF MORS AFTER REVIEW OF SAME AND CONFERENCES WITH R. KELBON AND B. FATELL REGARDING SAME	TARR	1.20
Feb 19 10	REVIEW PETROFSKY EMAIL	FATELL	0.10
Feb 19 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. TARR REGARDING VARIOUS PENDING MATTERS	FATELL	0.20
Feb 19 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON REGARDING OPTIONS	FATELL	0.30
Feb 19 10	REVIEW R. TIBBITTS EMAIL REGARDING OPTIONS AND DISCUSS WITH J. STORERO	FATELL	0.40
Feb 19 10	REVIEW AND EDIT EMAIL MEMO TO CLERK, DISCUSS WITH S. TARR	FATELL	0.20
Feb 19 10	EMAIL MR. JACKSON REGARDING FINANCING	FATELL	0.10
Feb 19 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH MR. PETROFSKY REFINANCING	FATELL	0.20
Feb 19 10	DISCUSS ISSUES WITH S. TARR	KELBON	0.20
Feb 19 10	RESPOND TO EMAILS(0.2); CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL(0.4); TELEPHONE CALL TO TRANSFER AGENT REGARDING SHARES(0.4); EMAIL R. TIBBITTS(0.1); EMAILS TO K. NIELSEN AND R. TIBBITTS REGARDING OPTIONS AND ESPP(0.2)	STORERO	1.30
Feb 19 10	PREPARE AND REVISE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE PAPERS FOR FINANCING MOTION	MOODY	0.90
Feb 19 10	SCAN, EFILE AND COORDINATE HAND DELIVERY TO CHAMBERS OF CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL REGARDING MOTION TO SHORTEN NOTICE OF FINANCING MOTION	MOODY	0.20
Feb 19 10	FINALIZE, SCAN AND EFILE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE REGARDING FINANCING MOTION	MOODY	0.20
Feb 19 10	CONFER WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING DOCKET MATTER, CONFER WITH B. FATELL REGARDING SAME, DRAFT RELATED COC AND ATTEND TO FILING OF SAME (2.0); REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING UCC SEARCHES (0.2); CONFER WITH B. FATELL REGARDING SHAREHOLDER REQUEST AND EMAIL SHAREHOLDER REGARDING SAME (0.3); CONFER WITH PARALEGAL SEVERAL TIMES REGARDING SERVICE AND CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE,	TARR	2.90

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	REVIEW SAME AND ATTEND TO FILING OF SAME (0.4)		
Feb 22 10	CONFER WITH J. STORERO ON STOCK CERTIFICATE ISSUES	KELBON	0.20
Feb 22 10	RESPOND TO EMAILS(0.2); TELEPHONE CALL FROM TRANSFER AGENT(0.6)	STORERO	0.80
Feb 22 10	FOLLOW-UP EMAILS WITH J. STORERO REGARDING STATUS OF STOCK OPTIONS	TARR	0.20
Feb 23 10	DISCUSSION WITH M. FISLER ON TOG, SALE OF MOBILITY, CONSULTANTS AND OTHER OPERATIONAL ISSUES	FATELL	0.50
Feb 23 10	REVIEW EMAILS FROM NEILSON AND J. STORERO ON STOCK	KELBON	0.20
Feb 23 10	EMAIL CLIENT(0.2); PREPARE INSTRUCTIONS(0.6)	STORERO	0.80
Feb 24 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER (2 CALLS)	FATELL	0.50
Feb 24 10	EMAIL REGARDING TOG	FATELL	0.20
Feb 24 10	EMAIL FROM M. BURTON REGARDING CREDIT AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.10
Feb 24 10	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING LIEN SEARCHES (0.4); REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING MORS (0.4)	TARR	0.80
Feb 25 10	REVIEW EMAILS AND SCAN MEMO (.4); CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY, A. NAGLE, P. HERFORD AND M. FISLER REGARDING TOG FEES (.9); FOLLOW UP DISCUSSION WITH L. CASEY	FATELL	1.30
Feb 25 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER REGARDING DEBTOR LOAN	FATELL	0.30
Feb 25 10	REVIEW EMAIL FROM OPA ON BALANCE SHEET AND SEND EMAIL TO OPA ON ISSUES RAISED	KELBON	0.20
Feb 25 10	EMAILS TO AND FROM J. STORERO; CONFERENCE WITH J. STORERO ON STOCK CERTIFICATES ISSUES	KELBON	0.20
Feb 25 10	EMAIL CLIENT(0.2); REVISE INSTRUCTIONS(0.8); CONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON(0.2)	STORERO	1.20
Feb 25 10	REVIEW OPA EMAIL REGARDING COMMISSIONS (0.4); REVIEW DE MINIMIS ASSET SALE ORDER, OPA EMAIL AND REVIEW FORM OF NOTICE REGARDING SAME; EMAIL OPA REGARDING SAME (0.6); EMAILS WITH OPA, BLANK ROME TEAM REGARDING SALE MOTION FILING (0.3)	TARR	1.30
Feb 26 10	REVIEW REPORT FROM A. NAGLE ON OPERATING	FATELL	0.10

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	EXPENSES		
Feb 26 10	REVIEW NOVELL OBJECTION TO FINANCING MOTION	FATELL	0.30
Feb 26 10	REVIEW EMAILS ON STOCK ISSUES AND OPERATING REPORTS	KELBON	0.10
Feb 26 10	REVIEW OPERATING REPORTS; PREPARE EMAIL TO OPA REGARDING SAME AND QUESTIONS RAISED	KELBON	0.40
Feb 26 10	REVIEW FINANCING OBJECTION BY NOVELL	KELBON	0.30
Feb 26 10	REVIEW NOVELL OBJECTION TO FINANCING MOTION, DRAFT RELATED EMAIL TO SCO, BLANK ROME TEAM AND LENDER'S COUNSEL, AND REVIEW SEVERAL EMAILS REGARDING SAME (0.9); REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING MORS (0.2)	TARR	1.10
Feb 27 10	RESEARCH REGARDING RESPONSE TO NOVELL OBJECTION AND EMAIL B. FATELL, R. KELBON REGARDING SAME	TARR	1.20
Feb 28 10	EMAILS REGARDING FINANCING	FATELL	0.20
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 04	TOTAL VALUE: \$141,571.50		262.40

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
 Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 05			
Jan 06 10	ATTEND TO ISSUE WITH JANUARY OMNIBUS HEARING DATE AND CONFER WITH CHAMBERS	TARR	0.50
Jan 07 10	RESEARCH AND SUBMIT PAYMENT OF OUTSTANDING BILLS REGARDING 2009 HEARING TRANSCRIPT REQUESTS	MOODY	0.20
Jan 12 10	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS AND PLEADINGS; CIRCULATE SAME	MOODY	0.20
Jan 19 10	EMAIL TO B. FATELL COPY OF RECENT DOCKET	MOODY	0.10
Jan 24 10	REVIEW CNO AND AGENDA, EMAIL B. FATELL REGARDING SAME	TARR	0.30
Jan 26 10	ATTEND TO REVISED AGENDA CANCELING HEARING	TARR	0.30
Feb 16 10	PREPARE NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED HEARING FOR 3/5/10 .2; FINALIZE, SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE SAME .5	MOODY	0.70
Feb 16 10	CONFER WITH T. MOODY, B. FATELL REGARDING NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED HEARING	TARR	0.30
Feb 22 10	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS AND PLEADINGS	MOODY	0.30
Feb 26 10	REVIEW AND FORMAT SALE MOTION, NOTICE AND PROPOSED ORDER FOR EFILING PURPOSES (0.2); REVIEW AND FORMAT EXHIBIT DOCUMENTATION PURSUANT TO LOCAL RULE RESTRICTING SIZE OF PDF IMAGES (0.5); DRAFT CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE / SERVICE LIST AND PREPARE FOR SERVICE OF MOTION (0.3); EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH S. TARR (0.2); EFILE SALE MOTION (0.1); SERVICE OF MOTION UPON ALL PARTIES LISTED ON THE 2002 SERVICE LIST VIA FIRST CLASS MAIL (0.4)	SENESE	1.70
PROJECT CODE TOTALS	05	TOTAL VALUE:	\$1,288.50 4.60

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 06			
Jan 04 10	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING WITNESSES	FATELL	0.10
Jan 04 10	EMAIL TO T. NORMAND REGARDING REPLY TO NOVELL MOTION	FATELL	0.10
Jan 04 10	EMAIL FROM E. CAHN ON SUSE HEARING ISSUES	KELBON	0.10
Jan 05 10	REVIEW DRAFT REPLY BRIEF AND DISCUSS WITH T. NORMAND	FATELL	0.80
Jan 05 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING WITNESS PREPARATION	FATELL	0.20
Jan 05 10	MULTIPLE EMAIL DISCUSSIONS REGARDING OPPOSITION TO NOVELL'S RULE 60 MOTION	FATELL	0.40
Jan 05 10	REVIEW REVISED OPPOSITION	FATELL	0.60
Jan 06 10	REVIEW AMENDED SCHEDULING ORDER IN NOVELL TRIAL	FATELL	0.20
Jan 07 10	REVIEW EMAIL HISTORY WITH WITNESSES	FATELL	0.30
Jan 07 10	EMAILS TO R. TIBBITTS REGARDING IP ISSUES	FATELL	0.30
Jan 07 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING NOVELL ISSUES	FATELL	0.50
Jan 08 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. TARR AND R. KELBON REGARDING EXPENSES OF LITIGATION	FATELL	0.40
Jan 08 10	MEETING WITH R. KELBON REGARDING EXPERTS FOR TRIAL	FATELL	0.20
Jan 08 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. GONZALEZ REGARDING WITNESS EXPENSES	FATELL	0.20
Jan 08 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. GONZALEZ REGARDING EXPERT WITNESSES	FATELL	0.10
Jan 08 10	FURTHER DISCUSSION REGARDING COSTS FOR UTAH LITIGATION	FATELL	0.20
Jan 08 10	MEET WITH B. FATELL ON TRIAL EXPERTS	KELBON	0.20
Jan 08 10	MEET WITH T. BIRON TO DISCUSS TRIAL EXPERTS	KELBON	0.20
Jan 13 10	EMAIL REGARDING TRIAL IN MARCH AND SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE	FATELL	0.20
Jan 14 10	REVIEW POWER POINT (0.3 HOURS); REVIEW COURT OF APPEALS CASE (1.5 HOURS)	TRAUB	1.80
Jan 15 10	TELECONFERENCE AND EMAILS REGARDING COURT	FATELL	0.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	RULING ON SUSE STAY RELIEF MOTION		
Jan 15 10	REVIEW COURT OPINION WITH S. TARR	FATELL	0.40
Jan 15 10	REVIEW SUSE ORDER, EMAIL SCO, TRUSTEE, BLANK ROME AND BSF TEAMS, AND CONFER WITH B. FATELL REGARDING SAME	TARR	1.00
Jan 15 10	REVIEW DAMAGE ASSESSMENT BY BOIES SCHILLER (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH E. CAHN RE: EMAILS AND COURT OF APPEALS OPINION (0.5)	TRAUB	0.70
Jan 19 10	EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCE REGARDING CALDERA	FATELL	0.30
Jan 20 10	REVIEW EMAIL REPORT ON MOTION OF GRAY REGARDING APPEAL AND SEEKING DISCOVERY FROM SCO	FATELL	0.20
Jan 20 10	DETAILED REPORT TO TRUSTEE ON TRIAL SCHEDULE	FATELL	0.30
Jan 20 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH S. SINGER REGARDING PREPARATION FOR TRIAL	FATELL	0.40
Jan 20 10	EMAIL WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING DOCUMENT MANAGEMENT FEES	FATELL	0.20
Jan 21 10	EMAILS REGARDING WITNESS PREPARATION	FATELL	0.20
Jan 21 10	EMAIL TO B. COMER REGARDING CALDERA DOMAIN NAME AND DISCUSS WITH S. TARR	FATELL	0.20
Jan 25 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING AUTOZONE SETTLEMENT (.2); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING LITIGATION (.3); MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS (.2)	FATELL	0.70
Jan 25 10	EMAIL S. SINGER REGARDING PRETRIAL CONFERENCE	FATELL	0.10
Jan 26 10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH LITIGATION TEAM	FATELL	1.00
Jan 29 10	CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING STRATEGY FOR NEGOTIATIONS WITH NOVELL	FATELL	0.60
Jan 31 10	EMAIL REGARDING LITIGATION STRATEGY AND POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT MEETINGS WITH NOVELL	FATELL	0.30
Feb 01 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING POSSIBLE MEDIATION	FATELL	0.20
Feb 01 10	EMAIL REGARDING TERMS FOR SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL	FATELL	0.20
Feb 02 10	REVIEW SUPPLEMENTAL PRETRIAL DISCLOSURES	FATELL	0.30
Feb 02 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING DEPOSITIONS	FATELL	0.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Feb 02 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS	FATELL	0.10
Feb 03 10	REVIEW SCO'S SECOND AMENDED SUPPLEMENT DISCLOSURES	FATELL	0.30
Feb 03 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON REGARDING OPTIONS	FATELL	0.30
Feb 04 10	EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. SINGER REGARDING TRIAL PREPARATION	FATELL	0.40
Feb 04 10	REVIEW NOVELL MOTION FOR EXTENSION TO FILE CERTIFICATION PETITION	FATELL	0.40
Feb 04 10	ADDITIONAL EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING K. MCBRIDE	FATELL	0.20
Feb 07 10	REVIEW DISTRICT COURT OPINION DENYING NOVELL RULE 60(B) MOTION	FATELL	0.20
Feb 07 10	REVIEW MOTIONS IN LIMINE FOR UTAH TRIAL AND EMAIL COMMENTS TO LITIGATION TEAM	FATELL	0.50
Feb 07 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS RELATED TO MOTIONS IN LIMINE AND REVIEW MOTIONS	FATELL	0.80
Feb 08 10	REVIEW MOTIONS IN LIMINE FILED BY NOVELL AND EMAIL BSF	FATELL	0.30
Feb 08 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING TRIAL PREP	FATELL	0.40
Feb 08 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING TRIAL EXPENSES, MOTIONS IN LIMINE AND OTHER ISSUES	FATELL	0.40
Feb 08 10	REVIEW NOVELL MOTION IN LIMINE NO. 2 AND EMAIL REGARDING SAME	FATELL	0.20
Feb 08 10	REVIEW COURT OPINION ON NOVELL SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION REGARDING SLANDER OF TITLE	FATELL	0.50
Feb 08 10	DISCUSS NOVELL MOTION IN LIMINE WITH R. TIBBITTS	FATELL	0.30
Feb 08 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING LITIGATION	FATELL	0.20
Feb 08 10	REVIEW EMAIL FROM S. SINGER	FATELL	0.10
Feb 08 10	REVIEW PROPOSAL FOR TRIAL EXPENSES AND EMAIL WITH S. SINGER	FATELL	0.30
Feb 09 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING TRIAL EXPENSES	FATELL	0.20

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Feb 09 10	TRIAL TEAM CONFERENCE	FATELL	0.60
Feb 09 10	EMAIL REGARDING TRIAL AND ACTION OF NOVEL	FATELL	0.20
Feb 09 10	EMAIL REGARDING TRIAL EXPENSES	FATELL	0.20
Feb 09 10	EMAIL REPORT FROM R. TIBBITTS REGARDING NOVELL	FATELL	0.10
Feb 10 10	EMAILS AND DRAFT LETTER REGARDING SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Feb 10 10	EMAILS WITH S. SINGER REGARDING EXPENSES	FATELL	0.10
Feb 10 10	EMAILS REGARDING LITIGATION AND TRIAL PREPARATION	FATELL	0.30
Feb 10 10	EMAILS REGARDING LITIGATION AND TRIAL PREPARATION	FATELL	0.30
Feb 10 10	MULTIPLE EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING TRIAL BUDGET	FATELL	0.30
Feb 11 10	EMAILS REGARDING LITIGATION BUDGET	FATELL	0.30
Feb 11 10	EMAILS WITH SCO TRIAL TEAM REGARDING SUSE HEARING FOR MIL	FATELL	0.20
Feb 11 10	EMAILS REGARDING SUSE STAY RELIEF PLEADINGS	FATELL	0.20
Feb 11 10	REVIEW MOTIONS IN LIMINE, COMMENTS TO R. TIBBITTS AND TELEPHONE CALL REGARDING SAME	FATELL	0.60
Feb 11 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. TIBBITTS (.2); EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.1)	FATELL	0.30
Feb 11 10	REVIEW SCO RESPONSE TO NOVELL MOTION IN LIMINE #1 AND DISCUSS WITH R. TIBBITTS	FATELL	0.50
Feb 11 10	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING DECEMBER OMNIBUS TRANSCRIPT AND NOVELL LITIGATION	TARR	0.60
Feb 12 10	REVIEW MEMO FROM R. TIBBITTS ON TRIAL PREPARATION	FATELL	0.10
Feb 12 10	REVIEW FINAL REPLY BRIEF IN OPPOSITION TO NOVELL MOTION IN LIMINE #1 AND COMMENTS	FATELL	0.30
Feb 16 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER (.3); REVIEW D. MCBRIDE LETTER REGARDING OPTIONS (.1)	FATELL	0.40
Feb 18 10	REVIEW MEMORANDUM DECISION ON NOVELL'S MOTION IN LIMINE #1; EMAILS TO CO-COUNSEL	FATELL	0.80
Feb 19 10	REVIEW MULTIPLE REPLIES AND RELATED EMAILS REGARDING MOTIONS IN LIMINE	FATELL	0.40

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Feb 19 10	REVIEW AND MONITOR MULTIPLE EMAILS CONCERNING RESPONSES TO NOVELL'S 21 MOTIONS IN LIMINE AND REVIEW DRAFTS	FATELL	2.80
Feb 22 10	REVIEW ORDERS REGARDING ADDITIONAL MOTIONS IN LIMINE	FATELL	0.40
Feb 22 10	REVIEW LENGTHY OPINION ON NOVELL MOTION IN LIMINE	FATELL	0.40
Feb 22 10	REVIEW WITNESS LIST	FATELL	0.10
Feb 22 10	REVIEW COURT RULINGS ON THREE MOTIONS IN LIMINE	FATELL	0.30
Feb 23 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING TRIAL PREPARATION	FATELL	0.40
Feb 23 10	REVIEW LENGTHY OPINION ON NOVELL MOTION IN LIMINE	FATELL	0.30
Feb 24 10	REVIEW LETTER FROM M. JACOBS RESPONDING TO LETTER REGARDING SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Feb 25 10	REVIEW PRETRIAL ORDER (.3) AND REPORT ON PRETRIAL CONFERENCE (.2)	FATELL	0.50
Feb 25 10	REPORT FROM R. TIBBITTS ON PROGRESS OF TRIAL PREPARATION	FATELL	0.30
Feb 28 10	EMAILS REGARDING TRIAL PREPARATION	FATELL	0.30
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 06	TOTAL VALUE:	\$22,343.50	34.10

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE:	07		
Feb 03 10	REVIEW EMAIL MEMO FROM R. TIBBITTS REGARDING LEASES	FATELL	0.20
Feb 04 10	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT LETTER AGREEMENT WITH KEVIN MCBRIDE	FATELL	0.50
PROJECT CODE TOTALS	07	TOTAL VALUE:	\$472.50
			0.70

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 08			
Jan 19 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH JOG REGARDING CLAIMS	FATELL	0.50
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 08	TOTAL VALUE:	\$337.50	0.50

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 09			
Jan 07 10	CALL WITH B. FATELL AND PATCH IN R. TIBBITTS ON ISSUES RELATING TO EMPLOYEES	KELBON	0.40
Jan 07 10	FOLLOW UP CALL WITH R. TIBBITTS AND B. FATELL ON EMPLOYEE ISSUES	KELBON	0.30
Feb 09 10	EMAIL REGARDING ETRADE AND COMMUNICATION TO EMPLOYEES	FATELL	0.30
Feb 12 10	REVIEW CONSULTING AGREEMENT FOR TWO EMPLOYEES AND EMAIL COMMENTS	FATELL	0.30
Feb 18 10	GUIDANCE REGARDING EMPLOYMENT TERMS	BIRON	0.20
Feb 23 10	REVIEW CONSULTING AGREEMENTS	FATELL	0.30
PROJECT CODE TOTALS	09	TOTAL VALUE: \$1,165.50	1.80

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 11			
Jan 04 10	MEETING WITH R. KELBON AND S. TARR REGARDING VARIOUS MATTERS INCLUDING OPTIONS, ASSET SALES, ETC	FATELL	1.30
Jan 05 10	EMAIL TO M. FISLER REGARDING SALE OF MOBILITY BUSINESS	FATELL	0.10
Jan 06 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING DISCUSSIONS ON ASSET SALES	FATELL	0.50
Jan 07 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. TARR REGARDING SALE OF MOBILITY	FATELL	0.20
Jan 11 10	REVIEW AND COMMENTS TO TERM SHEET FOR SALE OF MOBILITY	FATELL	0.30
Jan 13 10	EMAILS REGARDING AGREEMENT WITH NORRIS	FATELL	0.20
Jan 13 10	REVIEW DRAFT LETTER OF INTENT AND EDIT	FATELL	0.50
Jan 15 10	REVIEW AND EDIT EMAIL TO POTENTIAL PURCHASER	FATELL	0.20
Jan 15 10	REVIEW PROPOSAL FOR MOBILE BUSINESS	TRAUB	0.30
Jan 19 10	REVIEW AND EDIT APA FOR MOBILITY	FATELL	2.00
Jan 19 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH S. TARR REGARDING MOBILITY	FATELL	0.50
Jan 20 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER AND VINOD REGARDING SALE OF MOBILITY	FATELL	0.10
Jan 20 10	FOLLOW UP WITH B. FATELL REGARDING ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY BUSINESS(0.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DIBIASE REGARDING CORPORATE ISSUES IN AGREEMENT(0.2); REVIEW BACKGROUND OF BUSINESS AND TERM SHEET FOR DEAL(0.2); DRAFT PURCHASE AGREEMENT(1.0)	CASEY SPAN	3.20
Jan 21 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CASEY REGARDING MOBILITY SALE AGREEMENT; MEETING WITH S. TARR REGARDING PUBLICATION	FATELL	0.20
Jan 21 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING SALE OF MOBILITY	FATELL	0.20
Jan 21 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING MOBILITY SALE	FATELL	0.20
Jan 21 10	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE REGARDING DOMAIN NAME OWNERSHIP(0.1); CONDUCT DILIGENCE REGARDING SAME(0.4)	VAITL	0.40
Jan 21 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY	CASEY SPAN	8.20

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
 Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	BUSINESS(0.3); ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF TERM SHEET(2.0); REVIEW RESULTS OF SEARCH OF PUBLIC RECORDS(2.4); FURTHER REVISIONS PURCHASE AGREEMENT(2.6); DRAFT EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO B. FATELL A ND K. DIBIASE REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES IN AGREEMENT(0.7); FOLLOW UP WITH S. TARR REGARDING ADVERTISEMENT OF TRANSACTION(0.2)		
Jan 21 10	REVIEW LETTER OF INTENT	DIBIASE	0.30
Jan 21 10	REVIEW AUCTION AND SALE HEARING NOTICE FROM OPA (0.4); REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING DE MINIMIS SALE OF DOMAIN NAME, CONFER WITH D. CARICKHOFF REGARDING SAME AND EMAIL SCO, OPA AND B. FATELL REGARDING SAME(1.2); PREPARE NOTICE OF SALE (0.4)	TARR	2.00
Jan 22 10	REVIEW AND REVISE ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY A ND DISCUSS WITH L. CASEY	FATELL	2.30
Jan 22 10	REVIEW K. DIBIASE'S REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY ASSETS(0.4); ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT(1.0); REVIEW B. FATELL'S REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT(0.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT(0.4); FINALIZE REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT(0.8); DISTRIBUTE TO WORKING GROUP(0.2)	CASEY SPAN	3.20
Jan 22 10	REVIEW DRAFT ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT(0.4); REVISE SAME(0.4); E-MAIL MEMORANDUM TO L. CASEY AND B. FATELL REGARDING SAME(1.6); REVIEW B. FATELL COMMENTS TO SAME(0.4)	DIBIASE	2.80
Jan 22 10	CONFER WITH J. SHAPIRO, B. FATELL REGARDING SALE NOTICES (0.4); CONFER WITH B. FATELL, M. FISLER REGARDING DE MINIMIS SALE OF DOMAIN NAME (0.3)	TARR	0.70
Jan 25 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. FISLER REGARDING SALE OF MOBILITY AND REVIEW RELATED CORRESPONDENCE	FATELL	0.30
Jan 25 10	EMAIL B. COMER REGARDING SALE OF DOMAIN NAME	FATELL	0.10
Jan 25 10	REVIEW ADDITIONAL TECHNICAL INFORMATION FOR ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT(0.3); FOLLOW UP WITH M. FISLER AND A. NAGLE REGARDING SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT(0.6); REVIEW AND REVISE TECHNICAL INFORMATION FOR SCHEDULE(0.6); ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT(1.5); CONFERENCE WITH C. JACOBS REGARDING TAX ISSUES(0.3)	CASEY SPAN	3.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Jan 26 10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. CASEY AND SCO REGARDING MOBILITY ASSET SALE	FATELL	0.80
Jan 26 10	REVIEW AND REVISE APA	JACOBS	1.00
Jan 26 10	REVIEW COMMENTS FROM WORKING GROUP(0.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING OPEN ISSUES IN PURCHASE AGREEMENT(0.5); ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT(2.5)	CASEY SPAN	3.40
Jan 27 10	REVIEW MOBILITY APA	FATELL	1.00
Jan 27 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY TO REVIEW AND EDIT MOBILITY APA	FATELL	0.80
Jan 27 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT(0.8); FURTHER REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT(2.0)	CASEY SPAN	2.80
Jan 28 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING FINAL REVISIONS TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT(0.3); FINALIZE REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT(2.0)	CASEY SPAN	2.30
Jan 29 10	REVIEW AND REVISE SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT FOR PURCHASE OF MOBILITY ASSETS(1.0); REVIEW CUSTOMER AGREEMENTS TO BE TRANSFERRED(0.7)	CASEY SPAN	1.70
Feb 02 10	FURTHER REVISIONS TO PROPOSED SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY ASSETS(2.0); ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF ASSIGNMENT ISSUES IN CONTRACTS(0.6); CONFERENCE WITH J. STEFANSKI REGARDING RESEARCH OF ASSIGNMENT ISSUES(0.2)	CASEY SPAN	2.80
Feb 03 10	EMAILS REGARDING MOBILITY BUSINESS	FATELL	0.20
Feb 03 10	RESEARCH APPLICABLE CASE LAW REGARDING ASSIGNMENT PROVISIONS IN LICENSING AGREEMENTS	STEFANSKI	3.40
Feb 04 10	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND EMAILS REGARDING NEGOTIATIONS ON SALE OF MOBILITY BUSINESS	FATELL	0.50
Feb 04 10	REVIEW REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY BUSINESS(0.7); FOLLOW UP WITH BUSINESS TEAM REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES(0.6)	CASEY SPAN	1.30
Feb 05 10	COMPLETE RESEARCH REGARDING ASSIGNMENT PROVISIONS IN LICENSING AGREEMENTS(2.0); DRAFT REPORTING EMAIL TO L. CASEY REGARDING FINDINGS(0.1); REVISE AND EDIT EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE(0.2)	STEFANSKI	2.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Feb 08 10	REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF APA	JACOBS	0.40
Feb 08 10	REVIEW PURCHASER'S REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT(1.8); FOLLOW UP WITH M. FISLER AND R. TIBBITTS(0.4)	CASEY SPAN	2.20
Feb 09 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY	FATELL	0.30
Feb 09 10	ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF PURCHASER'S REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT; FOLLOW UP WITH COUNSEL FOR PURCHASER; FOLLOW UP WITH R. TIBBITTS; REVIEW AND REVISE AGREEMENT; ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF CONTRACTS TO BE ASSIGNED; FOLLOW UP WITH A. NAGLE	CASEY SPAN	2.80
Feb 10 10	EMAILS REGARDING MOBILITY SALE	FATELL	0.20
Feb 11 10	REVIEW DRAFT ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY BUSINESS	FATELL	0.70
Feb 11 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. TARR REGARDING SALE MOTION	FATELL	0.20
Feb 11 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CASEY AND REVIEW AND DISCUSS MOBILITY ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT	FATELL	1.00
Feb 11 10	REVIEW MOBILITY ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT ISSUES WITH A. NAGLE, M. FISLER AND L. CASEY	FATELL	1.20
Feb 11 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING ISSUES IN PURCHASER'S REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER AND R. TIBBITTS REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES IN REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT; FOLLOW UP WITH J. DANIELS REGARDING SALE OF DATA; FINALIZE REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT; DRAFT ASSIGNMENT AND ASSUMPTION AGREEMENT	CASEY SPAN	5.20
Feb 12 10	FINALIZE ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT, EMAILS WITH M. WELLS; EMAILS WITH OCEAN PARK	FATELL	0.70
Feb 12 10	MEET WITH J. BEE TO DISCUSS PREPARING SALE MOTION	FATELL	0.30
Feb 12 10	REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT AFFIDAVIT FOR SALE MOTION	FATELL	0.30
Feb 12 10	EMAIL WITH A. NAGLE REGARDING COMMENT ON MOBILITY SALE	FATELL	0.20
Feb 12 10	DISCUSS CONFIDENTIAL CONSUMER INFORMATION ISSUES WITH J. SHAPIRO	FATELL	0.40
Feb 12 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH COURT AND MULTIPLE EMAILS	FATELL	0.40

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	REGARDING HEARING DATE AND DEADLINE TO FILE FINANCING AND SALE MOTIONS		
Feb 12 10	REVIEW CHANGES TO SALE OF MOBILITY AGREEMENT AND EDIT; TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. DANIELS REGARDING TRANSFER PERSONAL INFORMATION	FATELL	6.00
Feb 12 10	FINALIZE MOBILITY ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT INCLUDING EMAILS WITH CLIENT AND TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. WELLS	FATELL	1.70
Feb 12 10	EMAIL TO L. CASEY REGARDING PRIVACY OF CONSUMER INFORMATION; TELEPHONE CALL WITH B. FATELL REGARDING SAME.	DANIELS	0.30
Feb 12 10	MEET WITH B. FATTEL REGARDING PREPARATION OF ASSET SALE MOTION, ORDER, AND RELATED AFFIDAVIT (.3); DRAFT ASSET SALE MOTION, ORDER, AND RELATED AFFIDAVIT (.7)	BEE	1.00
Feb 13 10	DRAFT INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY ASSIGNMENT AGREEMENT; FINALIZE REVISIONS TO SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT AND ASSIGNMENT AND ASSUMPTION AGREEMENT; FINALIZE REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT	CASEY SPAN	4.40
Feb 13 10	DRAFT MOTION FOR SALE OF ASSETS UNDER SECTION 363	BEE	4.20
Feb 14 10	REVISE MOTION FOR SALE OF ASSETS UNDER SECTION 363(1.2); DRAFT ORDER AND ASSOCIATED AFFIDAVIT (2.0)	BEE	3.20
Feb 15 10	REVISE SALE MOTION AND RELATED DOCUMENTS	FATELL	1.80
Feb 15 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING SALE AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Feb 15 10	EMAIL FROM M. WELLS REGARDING ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.10
Feb 16 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. STORERO (.2); DRAFT LETTER TO D. MCBRIDE (.2)	FATELL	0.40
Feb 16 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. ROTENBERG REGARDING PLEDGE OF STOCK OF FOREIGN SUBSIDIARIES AND OTHER LOAN AGREEMENT ISSUES	FATELL	0.30
Feb 16 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. TARR REGARDING SALE MOTION	FATELL	0.20
Feb 16 10	REVIEW PRESENTATION MATERIALS FROM OCEAN PARK ADVISORS	FATELL	0.40

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Feb 16 10	REVIEW LOAN AGREEMENT AND SEND DETAILED EMAIL TO LENDERS COUNSEL	FATELL	0.50
Feb 16 10	REVIEW AND FURTHER REVISE SALE MOTION AND RELATED DOCUMENTS	FATELL	1.30
Feb 16 10	ANALYZE BANKRUPTCY CASES REGARDING SALE MOTION (.3); CONFER WITH J. SHAPIRO (.5)	FATELL	0.80
Feb 16 10	REVIEW OUTSTANDING ISSUES IN DRAFT OF ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT; REVIEW TRANSFER ISSUES IN AGREEMENT WITH FRANKLIN COVEY; FOLLOW UP WITH M. FISLER AND R. TIBBITTS REGARDING APPLICABLE CONTRACT ISSUES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT; ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT, ASSIGNMENT AND ASSUMPTION AGREEMENT AND INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY ASSIGNMENT AGREEMENT	CASEY SPAN	5.80
Feb 16 10	REVISIONS TO MOBILITY SALE MOTION AND RESEARCH REGARDING SAME	TARR	2.70
Feb 17 10	MULTIPLE EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING MOBILITY BUSINESS AND DISCUSS WITH L. CASEY	FATELL	0.20
Feb 17 10	MEETING WITH S. TARR REGARDING SALE MOTION	FATELL	0.20
Feb 17 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CASEY REGARDING SALE AGREEMENT (SEVERAL CALLS)	FATELL	0.30
Feb 17 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING SALE OF MOBILITY (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CASEY REGARDING SAME (.1)	FATELL	0.30
Feb 17 10	EMAIL M. FISLER REGARDING AGREEMENT WITH D. MCBRIDE	FATELL	0.20
Feb 17 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING SALE OF MOBILITY	FATELL	0.10
Feb 17 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CASEY REGARDING MOBILITY ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT; EMAILS REGARDING SAME	FATELL	0.20
Feb 17 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING MOBILITY SALE	FATELL	0.20
Feb 17 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING ISSUES IN SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT; FOLLOW UP TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. NAGLE REGARDING SOURCE CODE LICENSING ISSUES; FINALIZE SCHEDULES FOR ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT; REVIEW PURCHASER'S REVISIONS TO SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT; REVIEW AND REVISE SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT AND ASSET	CASEY SPAN	8.80

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
 Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	PURCHASE AGREEMENT; DRAFT SUMMARY OF OUTSTANDING ISSUES		
Feb 17 10	ATTEND TO DRAFTING AND FINALIZING MOBILITY SALE MOTION, INCLUDING REVISIONS, SEVERAL EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH OPA, BLANK ROME TEAM	TARR	5.00
Feb 18 10	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING SOURCE CODE LICENSE AND REPLY	FATELL	0.30
Feb 18 10	REVIEW SALE MOTION	FATELL	0.20
Feb 18 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CASEY REGARDING SOURCE CODE LICENSE	FATELL	0.10
Feb 18 10	REVIEW ASSIGNMENT WITH R. KELBON AND S. TARR(0.2); DATABASE SEARCH FOR CORPORATE INFORMATION(0.2); PREPARE LIEN SEARCH ORDER AND ESTIMATE OF SEARCH COSTS(0.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. KELBON AND B. FATELL REGARDING SAME(0.2)	KOWALCZYK	0.80
Feb 18 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER AND A. NAGLE REGARDING REVISIONS TO SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT AND ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT; ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO AGREEMENTS; FOLLOW UP WITH R. KELBON REGARDING SEARCHES OF COMPANY INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY; FOLL OW UP WITH J. VAITL REGARDING INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY SEARCHES	CASEY SPAN	4.40
Feb 18 10	REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM L. CASEY; REVIEW INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY SCHEDULES FOR SCO-MCBRIDE APA AND SOFTWARE LISTED; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. VAITL REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE SEARCH FOR SCO INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY	STEFANSKI	0.40
Feb 18 10	CONTINUE REVISING MOBILITY SALE MOTION AND EMAILS WITH OPA, BLANK ROME TEAM REGARDING STATUS OF FILING	TARR	1.10
Feb 19 10	EMAILS WITH OPA, BLANK ROME TEAM REGARDING STATUS OF MOBILITY SALE MOTION	TARR	0.20
Feb 23 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING MOBILITY SALE	FATELL	0.20
Feb 23 10	RECEIVE AND REVIEW LIEN SEARCH REPORTS; PREPARE FOR CHARTING	KOWALCZYK	0.30
Feb 23 10	FINALIZE ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT, SCHEDULES AND ANCILLARY DOCUMENTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR PURCHASER REGARDING ADDITIONAL ISSUES IN SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT; FOLLOW UP WITH M. FISLER AND A. NAGLE REGARDING CHANGES TO SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT;	CASEY SPAN	4.20

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	FOLLOW UP WITH COUNSEL FOR PURCHASER REGARDING FINAL OUTSTANDING ISSUES IN AGREEMENT; FOLLOW UP WITH C. JACOBS REGARDING PURCHASE PRICE ALLOCATION		
Feb 23 10	EMAILS, CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING NOTICE, FILING OF SALE MOTION	TARR	0.60
Feb 24 10	EMAIL L. CASEY REGARDING SALE OF MOBILITY	FATELL	0.10
Feb 24 10	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING ASSET ALLOCATION	JACOBS	0.20
Feb 24 10	RECEIVE AND ANALYZE LIEN SEARCH REPORTS(0.2); PREPARE LIEN SUMMARY CHART(0.2); SCAN AND IMPORT INTO CLIENT FILE IN DESKSITE(0.2); REVIEW WITH R. KELBON AND B. FATELL(0.2)	KOWALCZYK	0.80
Feb 24 10	ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO SCHEDULES IN ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT; FINALIZE REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT; FINALIZE DOCUMENTS FOR EXECUTION; FOLLOW UP WITH COUNSEL FOR PURCHASER; REVIEW TRADEMARK CONFIRMATION AGREEMENT WITH THE OPEN GROUP; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER REGARDING ISSUES WITH TRADEMARK LICENSE AGREEMENT	CASEY SPAN	4.80
Feb 24 10	REVIEW L. CASEY EMAIL REGARDING MOBILITY SALE AND CONSIDER SAME (0.4)	TARR	0.40
Feb 25 10	REVIEW AND EXECUTE APA FOR MOBILITY BUSINESS	FATELL	0.80
Feb 25 10	REVIEW BACKGROUND AGREEMENTS WITH THE OPEN GROUP; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL, M. FISLER AND A. NAGLE REGARDING AGREEMENT WITH THE OPEN GROUP; ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF AGREEMENTS; FOLLOW UP TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A NAGLE; FINALIZE ESCROW AGREEMENT FOR DEPOSIT UNDER ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY BUSINESS	CASEY SPAN	4.60
Feb 25 10	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING ESCROW AGREEMENT; REVIEW AND REVISE ESCROW AGREEMENT	STEFANSKI	1.10
Feb 26 10	MONITOR EMAILS AND PAYMENT OF DEPOSIT ON MOBILITY APA; APPROVE APA FOR FILING	FATELL	0.40
Feb 26 10	FINALIZE AGREEMENTS FOR EXECUTION FOR SALE OF MOBILITY ASSETS; FOLLOW UP ON ESCROW OF DEPOSIT; REVIEW TRADEMARK LICENSE AGREEMENTS AND BACKGROUND WITH THE OPEN GROUP	CASEY SPAN	2.80

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Feb 26 10	REVISE SALE MOTION FOR FILING AND ATTEND TO FILING OF SAME, INCLUDING DRAFTING MOTION TO SHORTEN AND RELATED ORDER	TARR	4.50
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 11		TOTAL VALUE: \$72,029.50	158.50

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 15			
Jan 08 10	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS; REVISE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL REGARDING OMNIBUS HEARING DATES	MOODY	0.20
Jan 11 10	REQUEST TRANSCRIPT OF 12/30/09 HEARING	SENESE	0.20
Jan 12 10	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS AND PLEADINGS; CIRCULATE UPCOMING HEARING DATES	MOODY	0.20
Jan 25 10	PREPARE AND REVISE 1/27/10 AGENDA PAPERS AND NOTEBOOK; SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE SAME	MOODY	1.50
Jan 25 10	ATTEND TO FILING OF AGENDA, INCLUDING REVIEWING AND REVISING SAME (0.3); VOICEMAIL TO CHAMBERS REGARDING HEARING STATUS (0.2); REVIEW OF EMAILS REGARDING HEARING TRANSCRIPT (0.2)	TARR	0.70
Jan 26 10	PREPARE AMENDED AGENDA FOR 1/27/10 HEARING; CIRCULATE SAME TO TEAM	MOODY	0.20
Jan 26 10	REVISE, SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE 1/27/10 AGENDA PAPERS	MOODY	0.60
Jan 26 10	SCAN AND EFILE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE REGARDING 1/26/10 AGENDA	MOODY	0.30
PROJECT CODE TOTALS	15	TOTAL VALUE:	\$964.00
			3.90

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
REPORT TOTALS		TOTAL VALUE: 244,836.50	478.40

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
------	-----------	------------	-------